
Item# Name Description
Qty/ 
Pack VENDOR PRICE NO BID QTY TOTAL

1 Book	Rings
1	1/4"	Hoover,	or	equal,	003-064	
(11-4)	100/box Box

PYRAMID	3517885	
$4.19

2 Book	Rings

1"	diameter,	100/box,	to	hold	
loose-leaf	paper,	made	of	two	
parts,	are	hinged	and	lock	secure Box

PYRAMID	1111061	
$4.49

22
Clay,	Model	
Magic Crayola	Model	Magic/white Each

PYRAMID	CRAYOLA	57-
4401	$2.29

27 Clips,	Binder

Black	Steel,	1	1/4"	wide,	5/8"	
holding	capacity	BC-M/Medium	
12/box,	Upright	nickle-plated	
handles	can	be	hung,	folded	flat	
against	clipped	material,	or	
removed	for	permanent	binding Dozen

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#032400	$0.38

28 Clips,	Binder

Black	Steel,	3/4"	width,	3/8"	
holding	capacity,	12	box,	Upright	
nickle-plated	handles	can	be	
hung,	folded	flat	against	clipped	
material,	or	removed	for	
permanent	binding Dozen

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#032397	$0.18

30 Clips,	Bulldog
No.	1,	1	1/4"	Hunt	Boston	#2001	
or	comp	12/box Dozen

PYRAMID	1270222X12	
$1.44

31 Clips,	Bulldog
No.	2,	2	1/4"	Hunt	Boston	#2002	
or	comp	12/box Dozen

PYRAMID	1270255X12	
$2.40

32 Clips,	Bulldog
No.	4,	3"	Hunt	Boston	#2004	or	
comp	12/box Dozen

LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	
$3.90

35 Clips,	E-Z-Up Waxed	adhesive	back,	20/box Box
PYRAMID	EZUP#220	
1142322	$2.19



36 Clips,	Magnetic
1	1/4",	School	Specialty	#003472	
or	equal Each

PYRAMID	1270347	
$0.30

NO BID	
SCHOOL	
SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	
SMART	
#077433	
*SOLD	AS	
24/PK	@	
$3.36;	
MUST	BE	
PURCHASED	
AS	24/PK	
$0.14

37 Clips,	Magnetic
2",	School	Specialty#003475	or	
equal Each

PYRAMID	1270370	
$0.25

NO BID 
SCHOOL	
SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	
SMART	
#077434	
*SOLD	AS	
12/PK	@	
$2.29;	
MUST	BE	
PURCHASED	
AS	12/PK	
$0.19

40 Clips,	Paper GEM,	NO.	1,	1	1/4"	100/box Box

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#084472	$0.16



41 Clips,	Paper
Standard	#1,	1	1/4"	non-skid	
100/box Box

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#084473	$0.16

43
Computer	Air,	
Canned

Air	Duster	canned	air,	all	purpose	
duster,	10oz	can,	aerosol Each

PYRAMID	READ	RIGHT	
RR3700	$3.99

45
Computer	
Screen	Cleaner

Read	Right	Kleen	&	Dry	Twinpak	
#TX1205,	contains	one	pre-
moistened	pad	with	cleaner/anti-
static	solution,	one	dry	cloth	pad	
for	wiping	screen	dry.	Not	for	use	
on	nylon	mesh	or	polarized	anti-
glare	filters;	10	twinpacks/box Box

PYRAMID	READ	RIGHT	
TX1205	(RR1205)	$5.95

47

Correction	
Fluid,	Bond	
White

Papermate	brand	Liquid	paper	20	
ml	bottle	#56401	(foam	
applicator) Each

PYRAMID	LIQ.PAPER	
5640115	$0.75

49
Correction	
Fluid,	White

Liquid	Paper	Brand,	White	#564	
18	ml	bottle Each

PYRAMID	LIQ.	PAPER	
5640115	$0.75

50 Correction	Pen
Liquid	Paper	Correction	Pen	#562-
01 Each

PYRAMID	LIQ.	PAPER	
5640115	$1.45

51 Correction	Pen
Pentel	presto	pocket	correction	
pen Each

LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	
$1.80

52
Correction	
Tape

Scotch	3M	#652	Post-It	cover-up	
tape,	2	line,	1/3"x700' Each PYRAMID	3M	652	$2.09

53
Correction	
Tape,	Pen

Pen	style	correction	tape	
1/5"Wx236"L Each

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	3M	
#652;SSI	#801203	$2.03

55
Craft	Sticks,	
Jumbo

Jumbo	wooden	craftsticks,	
6"x3/4"	x	1/12"	500/Box Box

PYRAMID	1281443	
$4.99



58 Crayons
Crayola,	Kindergarten	Size	8/Box	
crayola	#80 Box

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
CRAYOLA	#52-0080;	SSI	
#007542	$1.42

NO	BID	
PYRAMID	
PRANG	
00900	$0.65

62 Crayons

Twistables,	Slick	Stix,	Crayon	
grades	5-12,	Can	be	used	on	
surfaces	like	paper,	foil,	
cardboard,	foam,	poster	board,	
sandpaper,	paper	towels,	waxed	
paper.	Writes	like	lipstick	smooth	
and	creamy,	fast	drying.	 Pkg

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
CRAYOLA	#52-9505;	SSI	
#406861	$2.78

63
Crayons,	
Classpack

Crayola	Crayons	Classpack	#52-
8008,	8	colors	of	regular	size	
crayons	pre-assorted,	800	crayons	
per	box Pkg

PYRAMID	CRAYOLA	52-
8008	$39.95

66
Dry-Erase,	
Cleaner

Sanford	Expo	Dry	Erase	Cleaner,	
SAN	81803,	8oz	spray	bottle Each

PYRAMID	SANFORD	
81803	$1.79

67
Dry-Erase,	
Eraser	

Sanford	Expo	#81505,	White	
Board	Eraser,	removes	dry	erase	
markings	quickly,	cleanly.	Easily	
cleaned	with	soap	and	water Each

PYRAMID	SANFORD	
81505	$1.35

68
Dry-Erase	Pupil	
Boards

Melamine,	high	quality	dry-erase	
boards	10pkg Pkg

PYRAMID	CLI	35100X10	
$7.90

72 Erasers Vinyl		1x2x1/2	Prang	or	Mars Dozen
PYRAMID	PRANG	39701	
$3.95

74 Flag,	Outdoor Kansas,	Dura-Lite	nylon,	3'x5' Each
PYRAMID	VALLEY	
FORGE	1273176	$22.69

75 Flag,	Outdoor U.S.,	Dura-Lite	Nylon,	3'x5' Each
PYRAMID	VALLEY	
FORGE	3846904	$14.39



76
Folders,	Pocket	
Portfolio

Duotang,	#54128-00,	Leatherine	
stock	with	3	built-in	metal	
fasteners.	Two	pockets	for	sheet	
size	11"x	8	1/2",	Assorted	colors,	
25/box Box

PYRAMID	OXFORD	
50770	$6.59

77
Folders,	Pocket	
Portfolio

Twin	Pocket	Portfolios,	for	8	
1/2"x11"	sheet,	without	fasteners,	
Duotang	#50125-00,	Assorted	
colors,	25/box Box

PYRAMID	OXFORD	
50750	$5.99

78
Folders,	Report	
Covers

Report	covers	with	3	built	in	metal	
fasteners,	embossed	panel	&	
border.	11"x	8	1/2"	sheet	size,	
Duotang	#51258-00,	assorted	
colors,	25/box Box

PYRAMID	OXFORD	
52513	$6.79

80
Glitter,	Crystals	
Assortment

Assortment	12,	3/4	oz	jars	of	
glitter	with	shaker	tops.	Two	jars	
of	each	color	(red,	green,	blue,	
gold,	silver,	multi-color) Box

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#1451381	$2.68

81 Glitter,	Gold Ross,	16	oz	or	Glitterex	16	oz. Each
PYRAMID	1110949	
$6.95

82 Glitter,	Silver Ross,	16	oz	or	Glitterex	16	oz. Each
PYRAMID	1110972	
$6.95

83 Glue
Dab	N	Stick	School	Glue	2.5	oz,	
soft	bottle	w/unique	value Each

PYRAMID	1284132	
$2.49

90 Glue	Stick #381.91		.28	oz Each
PYRAMID	CLI	95128	
$0.19

91 Glue	Stick Ross	glue	stick	#95180	BD	.74	oz Each
PYRAMID	CLI	95174	
$0.49

92 Glue	Stick
Super	Size	.77	oz,	
Borden's/Elmer's	#E516 Each

LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	
$0.65



97 Ink,	Stamp	Pad 2	3/4"x	4	1/4",	Blue	CO-12 Each
PYRAMID	1112432	
$0.66

98 Ink,	Stamp	Pad
Carter/Dennison	#21-071,	2	
3/4"x4	1/4",	Felt,	747-785	Red Each

PYRAMID	1371921	
$1.69

99 Ink,	Stamp	Pad
Carter/Dennison	#21051,	2	3/4"x	
4	1/4",	Felt	748-188,	Green Each

PYRAMID	1372077	
$1.69

100 Ink,	Stamp	Pad	
Carter/Dennison	#21081,	2	3/4"x	
4	1/4",	Felt,	748-056	Black Each

PYRAMID	1371863	
$1.69

101 Key	Tags Avery	Metal	Rim,	50/box	#11-030 Box
PYRAMID	AVERY	11-303	
$4.80

102 Knife
Exacto,#1	Handle	with	blades,	
includes	5	blades	#X3311 Each

PYRAMID	EXCEL	19101		
$3.69

106 Labels Avery	White	Label	#5160 Box
LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	

$9.00

107
Labels,	Address	
Printer

Avery	#5160,	for	laser	printer,	1"x	
2	5/8",	11"	x	8	1/2"	sheet	size,	
white,	30/sheet,100	sheet/box Box

LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	
$9.00

113
Laminating	
Film 1.5	mil,	18"x500',	1"	core Roll

ACCO	BRANDS	GBC,	
Item#	3000003.	Order	
in	qty	of	2	rolls.	Bid	
price	quote	is	per	roll.	
$17.54

114
Laminating	
Film 1.5	mil,	25"x500',	1"	core Roll

ACCO	BRANDS	GBC	
Item#300004.	Order	in	
qty	of	2	rolls.	2	rolls	per	
box	Bid	price	quoted	is	
per	box.	$18.15

115
Laminating	
Film

1.5	mil	27"	clear;	500	1/152	m;	
27'/686	mm;	1'/25	mm 2	per	Box

PYRAMID	DOCULITE	01-
275-IC	$15.95



116 Magnetic	Tape

Magnetic	tape,	flexible	with	
adhesive	back,	cut	easily	with	
scissors,	1/2"x10'	roll Each

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#084870	$1.26	

118 Markers
Crayola	#7708	Classic,	Broad	Line,	
8/set Set

PYRAMID	CRAYOLA	58-
7708	$1.60

119 Markers
Crayola	#7709,	Classic,	Fine	Tip,	
8/set Set

PYRAMID	CRAYOLA	58-
7709	$1.55

120 Markers
Crayola	#7716	Tropical	Colors,	
Broad	Line,	8/set Set

PYRAMID	CRAYOLA	58-
7816	$2.09

124 Markers
Sharpie	Extra	Fine	Print	Pen	Black	
SAN35001 Doz.

PYRAMID	SANFORD	
35001	$6.95

125 Markers
Sharpie	Fine	Print	Pen	Black	
#30001 Doz.

LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	
$6.00

128
Markers,	Dry	
Erase

Expo	Dry	Erase	Purple	Markers	
(Chisel	tip) Doz.

PYRAMID	EXPO2	80008	
$7.49

129
Markers,	Dry	
Erase

Sanford	Expo	2	#80004	green	Low	
Odor	Dry	Erase,	Chisel	Tip;	12/box Box

LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	
$6.90

130
Markers,	Dry	
Erase

Sanford	Expo	2	#82001	Black	Low	
Odor	Dry	Erase,	Bullet	Tip;	12/set Box

LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	
$6.50

131
Markers,	Dry	
Erase

Sanford	Expo	2	#82002	Red	Low	
Odor	Dry	Erase,	Bullet	Tip;	12/set Box

PYRAMID	EXPO2	82002	
$7.49

132
Markers,	Dry	
Erase

Sanford	Expo	2	#82003	Blue	Low	
Odor	Dry	Erase,	Bullet	Tip;	12/set Box

PYRAMID	EXPO2	82003	
$7.49

133
Markers,	Dry	
Erase

Sanford	Expo	Chisel	Tip	Dry	Erase	
Black,	83001 Doz.

LEAVENWORTH	PAPER	
$8.00

136
Markers,	Dry	
Erase

Sanford	Expo	Dry,	Broad	Tip,	
contains	1	each	black,	blue,	green,	
red	#83074;	4/set Set

PYRAMID	EXPO	83074	
$3.19



137
Markers,	Dry	
Erase

98-8629	4	ct.	Dry-Erase	Markers	
Bullet	Tip	red,	green,	blue,	black	
Crayola Pkg

PYRAMID	CRAYOLA	98-
8901	$2.58

142
Markers,	
Highlighter

Avery	Dennison	Hi	Liter	#23555	
Assorted	Fluorescent	Markers,	5	
color/set Set

PYRAMID	AVERY	23555	
$4.49

143
Markers,	
Highlighter

Bic	Briteliner	Pocket	Highlighter	
asst.	colors,	sold	only	in	full	boxes	
of	12	same	color Doz.

PYRAMID	BIC	BLI/XX	
$3.69

144
Markers,	
Highlighter

Fluorescent	Highlighter	Yellow	
12/box Doz.

SCHOOL	SPECIALTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#1354259	$1.65

145
Markers,	
Highlighter

Sanford	Pocket	Accent	highlighter,	
Fluorescent	Green,	#27026,	
slimmer	body	with	narrow	plastic	
tip	and	a	pocket	clip.	Tip	is	sames	
size	as	single	line	of	data	
processing	type,	12/box Doz.

PYRAMID	SANFORD	
27026	$4.89

146
Markers,	
Highlighter

Sanford	Pocket	Accent	highlighter,	
Pink	#27009,	Slimmer	body	with	
narrow	plastic	tip	and	a	pocket	
clip.	Tip	is	same	size	as	single	line	
of	data	processing	type,	12/box Doz.

PYRAMID	SANFORD	
27009	$4.89

150
Markers,	
Permanent

Dennison	Marks-a-Lot,	black,	
#DEN-07-888,	regular	size,	broad	
(chisel)	tip,	waterproof,	
smearproof,	marks	on	any	
surface,	Non-toxic	ink Doz.

PYRAMID	DENNISON	07-
888	$7.39



151
Markers,	
Permanent

Dennison	Marks-a-Lot,	red,	#DEN-
07-887,	regular	size,	broad	(chisel)	
tip,	waterproof,	smearproof,	
marks	on	any	surface,	Non-toxic	
ink Doz.

PYRAMID	DENNISON	07-
887	$7.39

152
Markers,	
Permanent Faber	3000	Black Doz.

PYRAMID	LIQUID	MARK	
91201	$3.49

158
Markers,	
Permanent Faber	3000	Red Doz.

PYRAMID	LIQUID	MARK	
91207	$3.49

161
Markers,	
Permanent

Sanford	Sharpie	#35001,	Black,	
extra	fine	point Doz.

PYRAMID	SANFORD	
35001	$6.99

163
Markers,	
Permanent

Sanford	Sharpie,	black	
permanent,	#30000 Doz.

PYRAMID	SANFORD	
30001	$6.09

178
Notebook	
Binders 3	ring	binder	2" Each

PYRAMID	SAMSILL	
11602	$1.79

202 Paint,	Tempera
Washable,	Blue,	gallon,	non-toxic,	
Crayola	brand	ONLY	2128 Gallon

PYRAMID	CRAYOLA	
2128	$14.89

224
Paper,	
Clipboard

Letter	size,	brown	finish	AW39	or	
comp. Each

PYRAMID	1162437	
$0.73

228 Paper	Fastners No.2	RH	1/2",	Brass,	100/box Box
PYRAMID	LLI	3534476P	
$.051

229 Paper	Fastners No.3	RH	3/4",	Brass,	100/box Box
PYRAMID	CCI	3534500	
$0.56

231
Paper	Notes,	
Post	It 3M	635	AN	3x5	Neon	Lined,	5pkg Pkg

PYRAMID	3M	635-SAN	
$8.95

235
Paper	Notes,	
Post	It 3M	3x3	lined	pop-up	6pads/pkg Pkg

PYRAMID	3MR335	
$8.95

236
Paper	Notes,	
Post	It

3M	Post-It	#655-5UC,	3"x5"	Ultra	
Colors,	5	pads/pkg Pkg

PYRAMID	3M	655-SUC	
$5.95



240
Paper	Notes,	
Post	It

Scotch	3M	#653AN	(785-415),	1	
1/2"x	2",	assorted	Neon	colors,	3	
each,	lemon,	lime,	pink,	melon Doz.

PYRAMID	3M	653AN	
$5.49

241
Paper	Notes,	
Post	It

Scotch	3M	#654	Post-It,	
removable	self-stick,	3"x3"	
assorted	color Pad PYRAMID	3M654	$1.59

242
Paper	Notes,	
Post	It

Scotch	3M	#655,	Post-It,	
removable	self-stick,	3"x	5"	
assorted	colors Pad PYRAMID	3M	655	$1.79

NO BID 
SCHOOL 
SPECAILTY 
3,M #655-
5PK; SSI 
#785418 
*SOLD AS 
5/PK @ 
$7.18: 
MUST BE 
PURCHASE
D AS 5/PK 
$1.43 EACH

245
Paper	Post-It	
Tape	Flags

Blue,	use	to	highlight,	tab	or	color-
code,	clear	portion	adheres	to	
document,	colored	portion	sticks	
out	beyond	document	edge	1	
7/10"x	1"	pop-up	dispenser Pack

PYRAMID	3M	680-2	
$2.79

246
Paper	Post-It	
Tape	Flags

Green,	use	to	highlight,	tab	or	
color-code,	clear	portion	adheres	
to	document,	colored	portion	
sticks	out	beyond	document	edge	
1	7/10"x	1"	pop-up	dispenser Pack

PYRAMID	3M	680-3	
$2.79



253 Paper	Punch	 3	hole	Paper	Punch,	fixed Each

SCHOOL	SPECAILTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#025983	$3.14

254 Paper	Punch	
Hand	Held	1/8"	paper	punch	
Single	hole Each

PYRAMID	1111160	
$0.57

256

Paper	
Reinforcement
s

Prestostik	WPW-	200/pkg,	for	
notebooks Box

PYRAMID	3577681	
$0.69

262 Pencil	
#2	Decorated	"Christmas"	mixed,	
Box	of	12 Doz.

PYRAMID	MOON	
792113	$1.80

263 Pencil	
#2	Decorated	"Halloween"	mixed,	
Box	of	12 Doz.

PYRAMID	MOON	7903B	
$1.80

264 Pencil	
#2	Decorated	"Thanksgiving"	
mixed,	box	of	12 Doz.

PYRAMID	MOON	T899B	
$1.70

265 Pencil	
#2	Decorated	"Valentine"	mixed,	
box	of	12 Doz.

PYRAMID	MOON	7923B	
$1.70

266 Pencil	 #2	pencils	144/box Box

SCHOOL	SPECAILTY	
SCHOOL	SMART	
#084808	$6.50

283
Pens,	Flair	
Black Papermate	Flair	No.	843 Doz.

PYRAMID	8430152	
$9.19

286
Pens,	Medium	
Point Bic,	Round	Stic,	ball	point,	Black Doz.

PYRAMID	BIC	GSMLL	
$0.92

287
Pens,	Medium	
Point Bic,	Round	Stic,	ball	point,	Blue Doz.

PYRAMID	BIC	GSMLL	
$0.92

288
Pens,	Medium	
Point Bic,	Round	Stic,	ball	point,	Red Doz.

PYRAMID	BIC	GSMLL	
$0.92

295 Pipe	Cleaners
Jumbo,	12"	long,	1/4"	thick,	
assorted	colors,	100/pkg	#7110 Pkg

PYRAMID	1199918	
$0.86



296 Rubber	Bands size	33,	1/8"	wide,	1/4#	box Box
PYRAMID	ALLIANCE	
1147867	$0.69

299 Scissors
Fiskars	Only	#9451,	Teacher's	
Bent	Shears	Right	Handed Each

PYRAMID	FISKARS	9451	
$6.77

304 Staples
Swingline,	S.F.		4		#74711-35450,	
5000/box Box

PYRAMID	SWINGLINE	
35450	$1.91

309
Tape,	Book	
Binding

Scotch	3M,	Transparent	3"x	15	
yds.	845-3" Roll

PYRAMID	SCOTCH	845-3	
$6.09

310
Tape,	Book	
Binding

Scotch,	Transparent	1	1/2"x	15	
yds.	845-1	1/2" Roll

PYRAMID	SCOTCH	845-
1.50	$3.09

312 Tape,	Duct 2"	Tuck	or	Equal	2"x	60	yds. Roll
PYRAMID	SHURTAPE	
1510015	$3.59

313 Tape,	Masking
Scotch,	3M	#234-1,	1"x	60	yd,	
core	size	3" Roll

PYRAMID	3M234-1	
$4.79

314 Tape,	Masking
Scotch,	3M	#234-1/2,	1/2"x	60	
yd.,	core	size	3" Roll

PYRAMID	3M234-1/2	
$2.87

316 Tape,	Masking
Scotch,	3M	#234-3/4x	60	yd,	core	
size	3" Roll

PYRAMID	3M234-3/4	
$3.82

317
Tape,	
Packaging

Clear	Packaging	Tape,	Tough	Poly	
Film,	3"	core	1.89"x	54.7	yds. Roll

PYRAMID	3M	SCOTCH	
3750CL	$4.19

319
Tape,	
Transparent

Scotch	3M,	magic	transparent	
tape,	#810,	1/2"x	1296,	1"	core 2	Rolls

PYRAMID	SCOTCH	810-
1/2	$2.09

320
Tape,	
Transparent

Scotch	3M,	magic	transparent	
tape,	#810,	3/4"x	1296,	1"	core 6	Rolls

PYRAMID	SCOTCH	810-
3/4	$2.49

321
Tape,	
Transparent

Scotch	C15,	#5910;	3/4"x	1296",	
1"	core 12	pkg

PYRAMID	3M	5910	
$0.99


